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Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000

Thank you for your request for information which we received on Monday 17
February 2025. | am pleased to confirm the following.

1. The total number of patients currently on waiting lists for a gynaecology
appointment. If available, please provide this broken down by calendar year for
the time period referred to above.

3111

2. The average waiting time (in weeks) for a gynaecology appointment. If the
information is available, please break this information down by type of referral
(routine, urgent, etc.) or the type of appointment (general gynaecology,
colposcopy, fertility, endometriosis etc.) — If a full breakdown is not possible
please provide any aggregated data you can.

The percentage against 18 weeks - 25.3% and aggregate is 27.2%

3. The average waiting time (in weeks) from referral to confirmed diagnosis. If
the information is available please break this information down by condition
(e.g. endometriosis, polycystic ovary syndrome, fibroids, other (please specify
if available)). If providing waiting times by condition is not possible, please
provide an overall average for all gynaecological diagnoses.

MKUH does not record information in this way.

4. The total number of patients diagnosed with the above conditions in the
time period mentioned above. If this is unfeasible, please provide this data for
the most recent full year available.

MKUH does not record information in this way.

5. The average waiting time (in weeks) from diagnosis to treatment, broken
down by condition (e.g. endometriosis, polycystic ovary syndrome, fibroids,
other (please specify if available)). If providing waiting times by condition is
not possible, please provide an overall average for all gynaecological
diagnoses.

MKUH does not record information in this way.

As a teaching hospital, we conduct education and research to improve healthcare for our Chief Executive: Joe Harrison
patients. During your visit students may be Involved in your care, or you may be asked fo ) . i
participate in a clinical trial. Please speak to your doctor or nurse if you have any concerns Chair: Heidi Travis
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6. The number of patients currently awaiting surgery for gynaecological
conditions. If available, please provide a breakdown by condition.

715 — This information cannot be broken down further.

If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please
address your complaint to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS
Foundation Trust, Standing Way, Eaglestone, Milton Keynes MK6 5LD If, after
exhausting our internal process, you are still unhappy with the information received,
you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water
Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.

If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the
address above.

Yours sincerely

Freedom of Information Co-ordinator
For and on behalf of Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust

Any re-use of this information will be subject to the
‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice.

As a teaching hospital, we conduct education and research to improve healthcare for our Chief Executive: Joe Harrison
patients. During your visit students may be Involved in your care, or you may be asked fo ) . i
participate in a clinical trial. Please speak to your doctor or nurse if you have any concerns. Chair: Heidi Travis



