
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 

Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Thank you for your request for information which we received on 12 October 2018. 
 
I am pleased to confirm the following. 
 

Topic - Outlying and Digital Innovation in England 

Please answer the following questions for Milton Keynes University Hospital between September 
2017 and September 2018. 

1. What is the average cost of a bed per day? 
 
£397 
 

2. What is the average length of stay for a outlying patient? 
 
The Trust does not record this information 

3. What is the average length of stay for a medical patient? 
 
3.5 days. 
 

4. What is the average length of stay for a surgical patient? 
 
1.7 days.  
 

5. How many patients have been outlied per month in the past 12 months? 
6. What is the average number of outlying patients per week? 
7. What system does the hospital use to keep track of the outlying patients? 
8. Which month had the most outlying patients between September 2017 and September 2018? 

How many were there? and what was the average length of stay for these outlying patients? 
9. What percentage of all outlying patients exceed their EDD (expected date of discharge)? 
10. What percentage of outlying patients are moved after 5pm? 
11. How many elective operations have been cancelled as outlying medical patients are occupying 

surgical beds? 
 
With regards to questions 5 – 11 the Trust does not record this information in an electronic format. 
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12. How many patients have breached the A&E 4hr waiting target in in the past 12 months?  
 
This information is publically available at https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-
areas/ae-waiting-times-and-activity/ 
 

13. How many patients breached the A&E 4hr waiting target because there was a wait for a bed in 
the past 12 months? 

14. How many patients were directly admitted from A+E to a ward inappropriate for their acute 
condition? 
 
The Trust does not record the information requested in Questions 12 & 13 above in an electronic 
format. 
 

15. What are the names of the private companies that have sold digital products to Milton Keynes 
University Hospital in the last 12 months? 

16. Has Milton Keynes University Hospital purchased or licensed an application (App) from a 
private provider in the last 12 months. If so what was the total financial spend on this App in the 
last 12 months? 

17. Has Milton Keynes University Hospital purchased or licensed iOs or android handheld or 
wearable devices from a private provider? If so what was the total financial spend on this App 
in the last 12 months? 

The Trust is currently working with Zesty on a patient website/app that currently provides appointment 
information and the ability to cancel/rebook 

You are advised that this information is provided in accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
and is for your personal use. Any re-use of this information will be subject to copyright and the Re-Use of 
Public Sector Information Regulations (1st July 05) and authorisation from Milton Keynes Hospital NHS 
Foundation Trust will be required.  In the event of any re-use, the information must be reproduced 
accurately and not used in a misleading manner.  
 
If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please address your complaint 
to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust, Standing Way, Eaglestone, 
Milton Keynes MK6 5LD. If, after exhausting our internal process, you are still unhappy with the information 
received, you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, 
Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
 
If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the address above. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
Freedom Of Information Co-ordinator 
For and on behalf of Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
 

 
Any re-use of this information will be subject to the 

‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice. 
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