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Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Thank you for your request for information which we received on 30 January 2018. 
 
I am pleased to confirm the following. 
 

Question Response Note 

1 

Within your Trust 
how many patients 
have you treated with 
any variant of Eating 
Disorder in the year 
2016/17?  

Elective – 
4 

Emergency 
- 23 

Other - 2 

Included are all patients who were admitted to MKUH 
between the 1st April 2016 and the 31st March 2017, 
who had any of the following ICD10 Diagnosis Codes 
assigned to the admission.  This has not been limited to 
the primary diagnosis. 
 
- F500: Anorexia nervosa 
- F501: Atypical anorexia nervosa 
- F502: Bulimia nervosa 
- F503: Atypical bulimia nervosa 
- F504: Overeating associated with other 
psychological disturbances 
- F505: Vomiting associated with other 
psychological disturbances 
- F508: Other eating disorders 
- F509: Eating disorder, unspecified 
 

Note that if a patient had more than one admission 
during the time period with a different admission type, 
they will be duplicated across these results. 
 
Figures for outpatient attendances are not available, as 
MKUH does not record diagnosis against outpatient 
attendances. 

(Please state whether 
patients were treated 
as an inpatient, 
outpatient or non-
elective). 

2 

In the year 2016/17 
how many patients 
did you treat with the 
following conditions: 

    

a) Anorexia Nervosa? 12 

Included are all patients who were admitted to MKUH 
between the 1st April 2016 and the 31st March 2017, 
who had any of the following ICD10 Diagnosis Codes 
assigned to the admission.  This has not been limited to 
the primary diagnosis. 
 
- F500: Anorexia nervosa 
 
Figures for outpatient attendances are not available, as 
MKUH does not record diagnosis against outpatient 
attendances. 

http://www.mkhospital.nhs.uk/


b) Bulimia Nervosa? 

5 

Included are all patients who were admitted to MKUH 
between the 1st April 2016 and the 31st March 2017, 
who had any of the following ICD10 Diagnosis Codes 
assigned to the admission.  This has not been limited to 
the primary diagnosis. 
 
- F502: Bulimia nervosa 
 

MKUH’s clinical coding department have identified that 
the ICD10 code for ‘Bulimia Nervosa’ and ‘Binge Eating 
Disorder’ are the same. 
 
Figures for outpatient attendances are not available, as 
MKUH does not record diagnosis against outpatient 
attendances. 

c) Binge Eating 
Disorder? 

d) Eating Disorder 
Not Otherwise 
Specified 
(EDNOS)/Other 
Specified Feeding or 
Eating Disorder 
(OSFED)? 

10 

Included are all patients who were admitted to MKUH 
between the 1st April 2016 and the 31st March 2017, 
who had any of the following ICD10 Diagnosis Codes 
assigned to the admission.  This has not been limited to 
the primary diagnosis. 
 
- F508: Other eating disorders 
- F509: Eating disorder, unspecified 
 
Figures for outpatient attendances are not available, as 
MKUH does not record diagnosis against outpatient 
attendances. 

 
 
You are advised that this information is provided in accordance with the Freedom of Information 
Act 2000 and is for your personal use. Any re-use of this information will be subject to copyright 
and the Re-Use of Public Sector Information Regulations (1st July 05) and authorisation from 
Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust will be required.  In the event of any re-use, the 
information must be reproduced accurately and not used in a misleading manner.  
 
If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please address your 
complaint to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust, Standing 
Way, Eaglestone, Milton Keynes MK6 5LD. If, after exhausting our internal process, you are still 
unhappy with the information received, you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office, 
Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
 
If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the address above. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
Freedom Of Information Co-ordinator 
For and on behalf of Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
 

 
Any re-use of this information will be subject to the 

‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice. 


