
 

 

Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Thank you for your request for information which we received on 10 May 2019. 
 
I am pleased to confirm the following. 
 

A full breakdown of the number of non-disclosure agreements issued to staff at your 
NHS trust. I would like this breakdown to be broken up by year and to run from 2014-
2019, so displaying the exact number of NDAs per year and if possible any refusals to 
sign. Any added info about NDAs signed should be added - if not possible please 
leave out (e.g. position held by staff who signed etc. would be appreciated).  I would 
also like this breakdown to include the total cost of the NDAs issued each year, so 
total cost of NDAs per year. I would also like the number of staff in the trust for each 
year mentioned to be indicated.  

 

Year Division Department 
Financial 
value (£) 

2009/10 None None N/A 

2010/11 None None N/A 

2011/12 None None N/A 

2012/13 None None N/A 

2013/14 Core Clinical Stores 8,000 

2013/14 Bank Nursing 2,000 

2014/15 Core Clincal Histopathology 11,500 

2014/15 Core Clinical Catering 0 

2014/15 Surgery Ward based 1,500 

2015/16 Corporate Nursing 0 

2015/16 Corporate ICT 0 

2016/17 W&C Obstetrics & Gynaecology 0 

2016/17 Core Clinical Management 0 

2017/18 W&C Obstetrics & Gynaecology 0 

2017/18 Corporate Management 0 

2018/19 Finance Procurement 0 

 

 
 



 

 

 
You are advised that this information is provided in accordance with the Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 and is for your personal use. Any re-use of this information will 
be subject to copyright and the Re-Use of Public Sector Information Regulations (1st 
July 05) and authorisation from Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust will be 
required.  In the event of any re-use, the information must be reproduced accurately 
and not used in a misleading manner.  
 
If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please 
address your complaint to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS 
Foundation Trust, Standing Way, Eaglestone, Milton Keynes MK6 5LD. If, after 
exhausting our internal process, you are still unhappy with the information received, 
you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, 
Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
 
If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the address 
above. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
Freedom Of Information Co-Ordinator 
For and on behalf of Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
 

 
 Any re-use of this information will be subject to the 

‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice. 


