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Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000
Thank you for your request for information which we received on 17 June 2019.
[ am pleased to confirm the following.

1. The average time taken to fill permanent roles advertised on NHS jobs.
Please break down into grades such as SHO, Middle Grade, Consultant

Medical Staffing average time to hire for May 2019, from advert to start date
booked is 65 days for SAS Doctors and 88 days for Consultants.

2. The average time taken to fill permanent roles via an agency. Please break
down into grades such as SHO, Middle Grade, Consultant

No recruitment within last 12 months via Agency.

3. Whatis your locum spend for the last financial year? Please break down
into grades such as SHO, Middle Grade, Consultant

£K
Agency Medical Consultant  1,146.67
Agency Med 5PR 1,937.17
Agency Med SHO & HO 1,599.23
Agency Junior Doctor5TL 88.31
Agency Junior Doctor FY1 1.88
Agency Med Staff Total 4,773.35

4. How many total hours does your locum spend relate to in the financial
year? Please break down into grades such as SHO, Middle Grade,
Consultant.

The Trust does not record this information
5. How many permanent doctors were hired by your Trust in the last

financial year? Please break down into grades such as SHO, Middle Grade,
Consultant:

As a teaching hospital, we conduct education and research to improve healthcare for our Chief Executive: Joe Harrison

patients. During your visit students may be involved in your care, or you may be asked fo

participate in a clinical trial. Please speak to your doctor or nurse if you have any concerns. Chairman: Simon Lond
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1. SAS=6
2. Trust Doctors = 18
3. Consultant=7

6. Please could you provide how much the trust have paid to agencies for
introductory fees in the last financial year? Please break down into grades
such as SHO, Middle Grade, Consultant

The Trust did not agency introductory fees in the last financial year.

What is your average retention for your permanent doctor hires in this last
financial year? Please break down into grades such as SHO, Middle Grade,
Consultant

The Trust does not record this information, we monitor turnover as a percentage
of new starters vs leavers.

You are advised that this information is provided in accordance with the Freedom of
Information Act 2000 and is for your personal use. Any re-use of this information will
be subject to copyright and the Re-Use of Public Sector Information Regulations (1st
July 05) and authorisation from Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust will be
required. In the event of any re-use, the information must be reproduced accurately
and not used in a misleading manner.

If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please
address your complaint to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS
Foundation Trust, Standing Way, Eaglestone, Milton Keynes MK6 5LD If, after
exhausting our internal process, you are still unhappy with the information received,
you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.

If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the address
above.

Yours sincerely,

As a teaching hospital, we conduct education and research to improve healthcare for our Chief Executive: Joe Harrison
patients. During your visit students may be involved in your care, or you may be asked fo Chai .Si Llovd
participate in a clinical trial. Please speak to your doctor or nurse if you have any concerns. airman: simon Lioy
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Any re-use of this information will be subject to the
‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice.
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