
 

 

Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000 
 
Thank you for your request for information which we received on 18 May 2021. 
 
I am pleased to confirm the following. 
 

1. Number of yearly cataract surgery procedures between 2016-2019. 

 

 
2. How many cataract surgery lists with how many patients on them are usually run per 

week or per month? (excluding pandemic times) 

 

Pre pandemic (pre-March 2020). 

 

6 / week 

 

3. On which days of the week are the lists usually run? (excluding pandemic times) 

 

Pre pandemic (pre-March 2020); 

 

Every day except Monday 

 

4. Is there a difference made between patients that require an experienced surgeon and 

patients that may also be treated by less-experienced surgeons i.e., Junior Doctors? 

 

Yes 

 

5. If 4 is a yes, for which of the cataract surgery lists (question 3) are either experienced 

and less-experienced or only less-experienced surgeon available? (excluding 

pandemic times) 

 

Mixed lists (all) 

PROCEDURE Extraction of cataract 

  
Row Labels Count of MRN 

2018 490 

2019 966 

2020 291 

Grand Total 1747 

 



 

6. How and by which criteria are cataract surgery patients prioritized? (Before, during 

and foreseeably after the pandemic) 

Listing for surgery: 

• severely limited binocular vision  
• inability to work or drive  
• at high risk of falls due to vision 
• required to manage other sight threatening disease e.g. diabetic retinopathy, glaucoma 

management 

Listing for assessment for cataract surgery: 

• we used the Royal College of Ophthalmology 's prioritisation tool 

7. How many patients were on the cataract surgery waiting list between 2016-2019? 

 

This information is not recorded. 

 

8. How many patients were on average referred to your trust to receive cataract surgery 

per month between 2016 and 2019? 

 

Difficult to quantify as it would have come through as a general referral and then been 

allocated to subspeciality. 

 

9. Which characteristics (age, comorbidities, priorities etc.) did the patients have that 

were referred to your trust per month between 2016 and 2019? 

 

This information is not recorded. 

 
You are advised that this information is provided in accordance with the Freedom of Information Act 
2000 and is for your personal use. Any re-use of this information will be subject to copyright and the 
Re-Use of Public Sector Information Regulations (1st July 05) and authorisation from Milton Keynes 
Hospital NHS Foundation Trust will be required.  In the event of any re-use, the information must be 
reproduced accurately and not used in a misleading manner.  
 
If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please address your 
complaint to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust, Standing 
Way, Eaglestone, Milton Keynes MK6 5LD  If, after exhausting our internal process, you are still 
unhappy with the information received, you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office, 
Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF. 
 
If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the address above. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
Freedom of Information Co-ordinator 
For and on behalf of Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust 
 

 
Any re-use of this information will be subject to the 

‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice. 


