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Request under Freedom of Information Act 2000
Thank you for your request for information which we received on 11 January 2021.
| am pleased to confirm the following.

1. How many patients have been treated (for any disease) in the last three months with:
e Benralizumab 0
e Omalizumab 0
¢ Reslizumab 0
e Mepolizumab 0

2. How many patients have been treated in the last three months, for asthma ONLY, with:
e Dupilumab 0
e Upadacitinib 0

3. How many patients have been treated (with any medication) for severe asthmain the
last 3 months?

38

Included are the number of inpatients discharged from MKUH between 1st September 2020
and 30th November 2020 where any of

the following ICD10 Diagnosis Codes were coded to the inpatient spell as the primary
diagnosis:

- J450: Predominantly allergic asthma
- J451: Nonallergic asthma

- J458: Mixed asthma

- J459: Asthma, unspecified

- J46X: Status asthmaticus

If a patient has had more than one admission that fulfils the above criteria, they will only have been
counted once as the data provided is the number of distinct patients. Any asthma patients seen in
outpatients are not included in this figure, as MKUH does not record diagnoses against outpatient
attendances and is therefore unable to identify these patients. We have provided data for
September, October, and November as these are the most recent 3 months that are clinically
coded at the time of providing this response.

4. Of these patients, how many were children?
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patients. During your visit students may be involved in your care, or you may be asked to

participate in a clinical frial. Please speak to your doctor or nurse if you have any concerns. Chairman: Simon Lloyd



20

Included are the number of inpatients aged 15 or under discharged from MKUH between 1st
September 2020 and 30th November 2020 where any of the following ICD10 Diagnosis Codes
were coded to the inpatient spell as the primary diagnosis:

- J450: Predominantly allergic asthma
- J451: Nonallergic asthma

- J458: Mixed asthma

- J459: Asthma, unspecified

- JA6X: Status asthmaticus

If a patient has had more than one admission that fulfils the above criteria, they will only have
been counted once as the data provided is the number of distinct patients. For the purposes of
this question, a child is defined as a patient aged 15 or under. Any asthma patients seen in
outpatients are not included in this figure, as MKUH does not record diagnoses against
outpatient attendances and is therefore unable to identify these patients. We have provided
data for September, October and November as these are the most recent 3 months that are
clinically coded at the time of providing this response.

You are advised that this information is provided in accordance with the Freedom of Information
Act 2000 and is for your personal use. Any re-use of this information will be subject to copyright
and the Re-Use of Public Sector Information Regulations (1st July 05) and authorisation from
Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust will be required. In the event of any re-use, the
information must be reproduced accurately and not used in a misleading manner.

If you are unhappy with the information received in response to this request, please address your
complaint to the Patient Affairs Office at Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust, Standing
Way, Eaglestone, Milton Keynes MK6 5LD If, after exhausting our internal process, you are still
unhappy with the information received, you may write to the Information Commissioner's Office,
Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.

If you need any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact us at the address above.
Yours sincerely,

Freedom of Information Co-ordinator
For and on behalf of Milton Keynes Hospital NHS Foundation Trust

Any re-use of this information will be subject to the
‘Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations’ and best practice.




